
New Books March 2025: Adult
Fiction

A Long Time Gone by Joshua Moehling 

USA Today Bestseller "A big thriller with an even bigger
heart!" — Lisa Gardner, New York Times bestselling
author "Equal parts compelling mystery and riveting
family drama.

Place Hold

A Song to Drown Rivers by Ann Liang 

Xishi's beauty is seen as a blessing to the villagers of
Yue.

Place Hold

Back After This by Linda Holmes 

NATIONAL BESTSELLER • A woman returns to her
small Maine hometown, uncovering family secrets that
take her on a journey of self-discovery and new love, in
this warm and charming novel from the New York Times
bestselling author of Evvie ...

Place Hold

Battle Mountain by C.J. Box 

Outlaw falconer Nate Romanowski is off the grid and out
for revenge in this riveting new novel from #1 New York
Times bestseller C. J. Box.

Place Hold

Beautiful Ugly by Alice Feeney 

INSTANT NEW YORK TIMES BESTSELLER “Her best
book yet.” —Harlan Coben The million-copy bestselling
Queen of Twists Alice Feeney returns with a gripping
and deliciously dark thriller about marriage. . . . . . and
revenge.

Place Hold

Been Wrong So Long It Feels Like Right by
Walter Mosley 

A King Oliver Novel Walter Mosley. " You got plans ? " "
Not really . " " So , you wanna take a ride ? " It took
almost two hours to get there . We didn't talk very much
on the way . Gatormouth's death and departure felt like
the ...

Place Hold

Beg, Borrow, or Steal by Sarah Adams 

NEW YORK TIMES BESTSELLER • Two feuding
second-grade teachers (and neighbors) find themselves
teaming up in this new rivals-to-lovers romance set in
Rome, Kentucky—from the New York Times bestselling
author of The Rule Book and Practice ...

Place Hold

Blood Over Bright Haven by M.L. Wang 

A standalone dark academia brimming with mystery,
tragedy, and the damning echoes of the past. For fans of
Leigh Bardugo, VE Schwab, and Fullmetal Alchemist.

Place Hold

Blood Ties by Jo Nesbo 

It’s like Roy says about his roller coaster: “Once it’s
rolling, it’s too late to get off.” Blood Ties is a tense,
compulsively readable tour de force about loyalty, family
ties, and love that is as destructive as it is powerful.

Place Hold

Broken Country by Clare Leslie Hall 

I did not see it coming.” —Reese Witherspoon “Stirring
and mysterious…fires directly at the human heart and
hits the mark.” —Delia Owens, New York Times
bestselling author of Where the Crawdads Sing A love
triangle unearths ...

Place Hold

Casket Case by Lauren Evans 

Will she ever be able to understand how he can do what
he does, or will she have to lay her best chance at love
to rest? Casket Case is the heartfelt story of a small-
town girl who feels surrounded by death—literally and
figuratively.

Place Hold

Close Your Eyes and Count to 10 by Lisa
Unger 

" --Sarah Michelle Gellar, Emmy-award winning actress
An extreme game of hide-and-seek turns deadly in this
riveting new thriller from New York Times bestselling
author Lisa Unger, the "queen of thrillers you can also
discuss with your book ...

Place Hold
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Dead Man’s List by Karen Rose 

Homicide Detective Kit McKittrick's latest case exposes
the dark side of San Diego’s high society in this nerve-
shattering tale of romantic suspense from New York
Times bestselling author Karen Rose.

Place Hold

Dream Count by Chimamanda Ngozi
Adichie 

A major literary event, Dream Count is a thrilling, sizzling
new work that confirms Adichie's status as one of the
most exciting and dynamic writers on the literary
landscape.[Bokinfo].

Place Hold

Dream Girl Drama by Tessa Bailey 

A steamy chance encounter between a professional
hockey player and the manic pixie dream girl he just
can’t seem to forget takes a turn when the pair realize
that their parents are engaged—in an all-new rom-com
by #1 New York Times ...

Place Hold

Famous Last Words by Gillian McAllister 

This novel cements Gillian McAllister’s reputation as “the
best at putting her characters in impossible situations
and making her readers not only contemplate but feel
what it would be like to find themselves in those
situations.” ...

Place Hold

First-Time Caller by B.K. Borison 

INSTANT NEW YORK TIMES BESTSELLER A hopeless
romantic meets a jaded radio host in this cozy, Sleepless
in Seattle–inspired love story from beloved author B.K.
Borison.

Place Hold

Going
Home

Going Home by Tom Lamont 

"A funny, achingly sad, sneakily wise story of family and
what happens when three men-all of whom are
completely ill-suited for fatherhood-take charge of a
toddler following his mother's sudden death.

Place Hold

Good Girl by Aria Aber 

A story of love and family, raves and Kafka, staying up
all night and surviving the mistakes of youth, Good Girl
is the virtuosic debut novel by a celebrated young poet
and, now, a major new voice in fiction.

Place Hold

Homeseeking by Karissa Chen 

A GOOD MORNING AMERICA BOOK CLUB PICK
“Homeseeking is about the love of home and family,
even against unimaginable circumstances…[A]
sweeping epic.” —Good Housekeeping “Fans of
historical fiction will want to pick up this ...

Place Hold

Kills Well With Others by Deanna Raybourn 

Four women assassins, senior in status—and in age—
sharpen their knives for another bloody good adventure
in this riotous follow-up to the New York Times

Place Hold

Last Twilight in Paris by Pam Jenoff 

Description not provided

Place Hold

Leave No Trace by Jo Callaghan 

From the bestselling author of In the Blink of an Eye
comes an inventive thriller that pits algorithms against
experience, logic against instinct, and one undetectable
killer against two extraordinary detectives. “Unswervingly
gripping ...

Place Hold

Lie for a Million by Janet Dailey 

From the bestselling First Lady of Romance comes
Texas-style drama, scandal, and corruption set in the
world of ranching, when the death of a powerful man
leaves families at odds, a high-stakes reining
competition in the balance, and ...

Place Hold

Nobody’s Hero by M.W. Craven 

'' Simon Toyne, bestselling author of the Sanctus Trilogy
and Solomon Creed series ''Effortless. Thrilling.
Explosive...this series looks to take the world by storm.

Place Hold

Order of Swans by Jude Devereaux 

Bellis isn’t the remote island that she believed it to be.
It’s another world—a stunningly beautiful and seductive
one, with its own royalty, its own rules, and inhabitants
who breathe life into the tales she was taught were
fiction.

Place Hold
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Paranoia by James Patterson and James O.
Born 

NYPD Detective Michael Bennett will stop at nothing to
protect family: his wife, his kids—and his fellow officers

Place Hold

Playworld by Adam Ross 

Line for line the book is a revelation." —Leigh Haber,
Los Angeles Times THE NEW YORK TIMES BOOK
REVIEW EDITORS' CHOICE • A big and big-hearted
novel—one enthralling, transformative year in the life of
a child actor coming of age in a ...

Place Hold

Power of Persuasion by Selena
Montgomery 

Sometimes the power of love .

Place Hold

Stone Yard Devotional by Charlotte Wood 

Meditative, moving, and finely observed, Stone Yard
Devotional is a seminal novel from a writer of rare
power, exploring what it means to retreat from the world,
the true nature of forgiveness, and the sustained effect
of grief on the human ...

Place Hold

Sweet Fury by Sash Bischoff 

A twisty, thought-provoking novel told through the lens of
the film industry, and in conversation with the works of F.
Scott Fitzgerald, Sweet Fury takes a hard look at
America’s deep-rooted misogyny, and offers a fresh take
on the ...

Place Hold

The Close Up by Pip Drysdale 

In this glittering new psychological suspense novel from
internationally bestselling author Pip Drysdale, a writer’s
own thriller is brought chillingly to life when a stalker
begins to reenact the events from her book.

Place Hold

The Crime Brulee Bake Off by Rebecca
Connolly 

An unexpected romance.

Place Hold

The Inheritance by Trisha Sakhlecha 

As tensions builds, emotions rise and there’s only one
way things will end... murder.’ Woman's Weekly
‘Deliciously dark with chilling characters and a brilliant
setting. This is a pacy, page-turning thriller.

Place Hold

The Last Room on the Left by Leah Konen 

The caretaker at an isolated mountain hotel finds herself
fighting for her life—and sanity—in this twisty, addictive
thriller.

Place Hold

The Librarians of Lisbon by Suzanne
Nelson 

This tense page-turner peels back new layers in the
complexities of World War II espionage as it hurtles
toward its satisfying finish.” ―New York Times
bestselling author Kristin Harmel The romance of
Casablanca meets the spy world of ...

Place Hold

The Medici Return by Steve Berry 

The Medici Return takes Cotton to Italy to solve a five
hundred year-old mystery.

Place Hold

The Note by Alafair Burke 

What had they gone and done? The Note is a page-
turner of the highest order from one of our greatest
contemporary suspense writers.

Place Hold

The Paris Vendetta by Shan Serafin 

Lucky for him, his new companion has the instincts of a
killer.… The exhilarating first novel from filmmaker and
James Patterson collaborator Shan Serafin, The Paris
Vendetta is a pulse-pounding thrill ride through central
Europe’s most ...

Place Hold

The Three Lives of Cate Kay by Kate Fagan 

REESE’S BOOK CLUB PICK! “This story swept me
away with its big dreams, love, and unexpected twists.”
—Reese Witherspoon (Reese’s Book Club January ’25
Pick) The Seven Husbands of Evelyn Hugo meets First
Lie Wins in this electric ...
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The Three Lives of Cate Kay by Kate Fagan 

REESE’S BOOK CLUB PICK! “This story swept me
away with its big dreams, love, and unexpected twists.”
—Reese Witherspoon (Reese’s Book Club January ’25
Pick) The Seven Husbands of Evelyn Hugo meets First
Lie Wins in this electric ...

Place Hold

They All Fall the Same by Wes Browne 

An organized crime boss in Kentucky believes money
and power are everything until his enterprise collides
with a family tragedy in this gripping noir thriller perfect
for fans of S.A. Cosby and Eli Cranor.

Place Hold

This Is a Love Story by Jessica Soffer 

An homage to New York City, to romance, and even to
loss, This Is a Love Story tenderly and suspensefully
captures deep truths about life and marriage in radiant
prose.

Place Hold

Three Days in June by Anne Tyler 

A new Anne Tyler novel destined to be an instant classic:
a socially awkward mother of the bride navigates the
days before and after her daughter's wedding.

Place Hold

Time of the Child by Niall Williams 

"The writing in this book is lyrical . . . a beautiful book
that you will love.” -Good Morning America's #1 Favorite
Book of the Year "I am utterly obsessed with Niall
Williams.

Place Hold

Waiting for the Long Night Moon by Amanda
Peters 

From the bestselling author of The Berry Pickers In her
debut collection of short fiction, Amanda Peters
describes the Indigenous experience from an
astonishingly wide spectrum in time and place—from
contact with the first European ...

Place Hold

We All Live Here by Jojo Moyes 

... carefully under her eye . " I thought I might write a
letter . Just telling him how awful he's made me feel ,
and how I'd assumed we were all too old for this kind of
rubbish . " " Spoken like someone who has never been
on a 450 JOJO MOYES.

Place Hold

We Do Not Part by Han Kang 

THE NEW NOVEL FROM HAN KANG, WINNER OF
THE 2024 NOBEL PRIZE IN LITERATURE “[Han
Kang’s] intense poetic prose . . . confronts historical
traumas and exposes the fragility of human life.”—The
Nobel Committee for Literature, in the ...

Place Hold

We’ll Prescribe You a Cat by Ishida Syou 

A USA Today Bestseller A cat a day keeps the doctor
away… Discover the award-winning, bestselling
Japanese novel that has become an international
sensation in this utterly charming, vibrant celebration of
the healing power of cats.

Place Hold

Witchcraft for Wayward Girls by Grady
Hendrix 

In Witchcraft for Wayward Girls, the author of How to
Sell a Haunted House and The Final Girl Support Group
delivers another searing, completely original novel and
further cements his status as a “horror master” (NPR).

Place Hold

You Are Fatally Invited by Ande Pliego 

One by one, you’ll lose your turn. With a storm isolating
the island, and the body count rising, Mila must outwit a
killer who knows literally every trick in the book. Until
only one of us remains . . .

Place Hold

Large Print
A Great Marriage by Frances Mayes 

When a perfect wedding is called off just days before the
big event, it sends two people—and their families—
reeling, in this poignant novel from the #1 New York
Times bestselling author of Under the Tuscan Sun and
Women in Sunlight “A ...

Place Hold

Gingerbread Danger by Amanda Flower 

Still, Bailey is determined to find the perpetrator. If she
can’t cut out the killer from the rest of the suspects, her
gingerbread men won’t be the only ones in danger of
disappearing . . .

Place Hold
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Paranoia by James Patterson and James O.
Born 

When New York City's Mayor is desperate to find his
missing daughter, Detective Michael Bennett steps in to
help the Mayor and strike a deal to save his son in
prison.

Place Hold

Pony Confidential by Christina Lynch 

An NPR "Book of the Day" In this one-of-a-kind mystery
with heart and humor, a hilariously grumpy pony must
save the only human he’s ever loved after discovering
she stands accused of a murder he knows she didn’t
commit.

Place Hold

The Hitchcock Hotel by Stephanie Wrobel 

He is the founder, owner, and manager of The Hitchcock
Hotel, a sprawling Victorian house in the White
Mountains dedicated to the Master of Suspense.

Place Hold

Time Will Tell by Rita Mae Brown 

An eye-wateringly expensive watch is found discarded
on the land days prior to a dead body turning up. “Sister”
Jane Arnold sets out to find the connection between the
two, with a little help from her friend—both two legged
and ...

Place Hold

Non-Fiction
Against Platforms by Mike Pepi 

So what happened? In Against Platforms, technologist
and creator Mike Pepi lays out an explanation of what
went wrong – and a manifesto for putting it right.

Place Hold

Everyone Who Is Gone Is Here by Jonathan
Blitzer 

A New York Times bestseller • A New York Times Top 10
Book of 2024 • Named a Best Book of the Year by The
New Yorker, Chicago Tribune, Newsweek, PBS
NewsHour, LitHub, Kirkus Reviews, Publishers Lunch,
Christian Science Monitor, and ...

Place Hold

Helen of Troy, 1993: Poems by Maria
Zoccola 

But leaving isn’t the same thing as staying gone…
Rooted in a lush natural landscape, this stunning poetry
collection explores Helen’s isolation and rebellion as her
expansive personality clashes with the social rigidity of
her small ...

Place Hold

Homestead by Will Bardenwerper 

Small Town Baseball and the Fight for the Soul of
America Will Bardenwerper. another way to make
money alongside ... homestead, recoiled at the sight of
her husband's sanctuary, insisting that at a minimum the
avalanche of books ...

Place Hold

Minds Over Meetings by Kody Green 

With insightful advice on managing stress, starting tough
conversations, and creating a supportive work
environment, this book is an indispensable resource for
anyone looking to thrive both professionally and
personally.

Place Hold

Mostly Meatless from America’s Test
Kitchen 

Attention plant-curious cooks, semi-vegetarians, even
conflicted carnivores—anyone with a motive to eat less
meat. This vibrant collection of 200+ recipes fills a
needed middle ground with meals that center vegetables
while keeping meat on the table in a smaller and
occasional—but still satisfying—role.

Place Hold

New Prize for These Eyes by Juan Williams 

New Prize for These Eyes shows the promise of the
grassroots-led contemporary movement for civil rights
and racial justice, cautions us about how to navigate the
backlash and naysayers, and offers hope

Place Hold

Rock Painting for Beginners by Christine
Rechl 

Thailand's dramatic history spans centuries of conflict,
and this book recounts many of these fascinating
episodes, including: The true story of Anna Leonowens,
the British governess hired to teach the children of King
Mongkut, ...

Place Hold
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Saturday by Margaret Ross 

"Margaret Ross's highly anticipated second collection of
poems, Saturday, chronicles a brute education in love
and decorum through ceremony starter kits, basement
classrooms, and a mission school turned art camp,
seeking to "touch the myth ...

Place Hold

Super Italian by Giada De Laurentis 

With 100 stunning photographs of finished meals and
their superfood components, Giada teaches us that
when you start with truly excellent, minimally processed
ingredients, simply prepared, you can have

Place Hold

The Hidden Globe by Atossa Araxia
Abrahamian 

NAMED ONE OF THE TOP 5 BOOKS OF 2024 ON
CBS SUNDAY MORNING ONE OF THE WASHINGTON
POST'S TOP 10 BOOKS OF 2024 A NEW YORK TIMES
NOTABLE BOOK “Vivid, revelatory, and politically
unpredictable…What bothers Abrahamian, in the end,
isn’t ...

Place Hold

The Insider Threat by Adam Lovinger 

In return, through a range of acts and omissions
described in this book, America's adversaries helped
Obama and Joe Biden win elections, wealth, and
prestige.

Place Hold

The Let Them Theory by Mel Robbins 

Free from the exhausting cycle of trying to manage
everything and everyone around you. The Let Them
Theory puts the power to create a life you love back in
your hands—and this book will show you exactly how to
do it.

Place Hold

The New Fit by Aaron Leventhal 

Based on best practices developed over more than 20
years in the fitness industry and anchored in the latest
research on exercise and longevity, this timely book
empowers readers of any age to take charge of their
own wellness journey, ...

Place Hold

The Power Pause by Neha Ruch 

Her online community, Mother Untitled, has become the
leading voice and resource for women navigating this
transition. In The Power Pause, Ruch addresses all the
questions women face at this inflection point, such as,
Can I afford to pause?

Place Hold

We Who Wrestle with God by Jordan B.
Peterson 

Description not provided

Place Hold

Why I Cook by Tom Colicchio 

Through these meaningful dishes, gorgeous recipe
shots, and images from Tom’s childhood, Why I Cook is
the most personal look into Tom’s life yet.

Place Hold

Zoe Bakes Cookies by Zoe Francois 

In Zoë Bakes Cakes, bestselling author and expert
baker Zoë François demystifies the craft of cakes
through more than eighty-five simple and straightforward
recipes.

Place Hold

Biography
Damn Glad to Meet You by Tim Matheson 

Damn Glad to Meet You is a fascinating, hilarious, and
often very moving inside look at his extraordinary
career.”--Aaron Sorkin A “damn good” fun and revealing
memoir from the acclaimed Hollywood actor, Tim
Matheson For the past ...

Place Hold

Martin Van Buren by James M. Bradley 

They called him "the Magician," "the Red Fox" and other
names that celebrated his political skill. And, indeed,
there is no doubt that Martin Van Buren was the most
innovative politician of his age.

Place Hold
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